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After downloading the soft file of this Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto, you can start to
read it. Yeah, this is so delightful while somebody must review by taking their big publications; you are in
your new method by only manage your gizmo. Or even you are working in the workplace; you could still use
the computer to check out Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto completely. Certainly, it will
not obligate you to take lots of pages. Simply page by page depending upon the moment that you have to
read Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto

Amazon.com Review
Amazon Best Books of the Month, December 2012: We rarely hear grown women called "girls" these days,
unless they've gone wild, but it was common practice in the settings for Whitney Otto's affecting portraits of
female artists. The author, who has spun tales of women and crafts before (eight other ladies starred in her
1991 best seller, How to Make an American Quilt), takes a fresh approach here. More a novel in linked
pieces than a set of discrete works, Eight Girls Taking Pictures introduces a range of protagonists in various
eras and countries, each with a shutter-happy dream and an obstacle in the way of achieving it. These
roadblocks take the form of men--unrelenting fathers, unsympathetic husbands--and social trends, including
racism, homophobia, and aversion to the idea of females as creative. Otto's intelligent, sensitive approach to
the plight of these women gives Eight Girls its appeal: Safe in our modernity, we trust that their talent will
win out in the end. --Mia Lipman

From Booklist
Inspired by the careers of such ground-breaking photographers as Lee Miller, Imogen Cunningham, and
Grete Stern, Otto combines her personal passion for the art of photography with her perceptive impressions
of what life must have been like for those women who pursued their own creative and philosophical muses
during times when to be anything other than a wife-and-mother was to be an outcast from society. Through
loosely interconnected tales, Otto introduces eight exemplary fictional women photographers whose lives
and works document the exhilarating intersection of early-twentieth-century art and feminism. Traversing the
world from Berlin to Buenos Aires, Otto’s heroines find themselves both catalysts for and captives of
changing times and values. From the makeshift darkroom of the pioneering Cymbeline Kelley to the Parisian
portrait studio of Amadora Allesbury to the New York landscapes captured by Miri Marx, Otto’s
photographers battle society’s denunciations and personal demons as they seek love, acceptance, success,
and harmony. A visionary and distinctive look at the sacrifices and triumphs of daring women artists. --Carol
Haggas

Review
"Thoughtful, nuanced depictions of the complexity of women's lives...Eight Girls is a moving read about the
pleasures and pangs that define the lives of women today." (USA Today)

"A rich ensemble novel...full of glamour and grit." (New York Times, T. Style Magazine)



" Otto’s photographers battle society’s denunciations and personal demons as they seek love, acceptance,
success, and harmony. A visionary and distinctive look at the sacrifices and triumphs of daring women
artists." (Booklist)

“Otto skillfully develops each character and draws the reader in with rich detail that must be the result of
careful and extensive research. Highly recommended; those with an interest in photography, women’s
history, or feminist literature should particularly enjoy.” (Library Journal)

"Blending Otto's saturated yet accessible prose with her talent for stitching together stories of multiple
characters with a steady, glittering needle, the novel pays homage to a number of 20th-century photographers
whose lives inspired its eight interwoven tales. Otto's vivid narratives of these women's lives-often
bohemian, occasionally luxurious, always richly intellectual and full of love-render them as complete,
complicated mediums between their cameras and a world that treats them so ambivalently." (Portland
Monthly)

"The reader is captivated and transported on several levels with a book that rings with universal truths as it
pays homage to eight very real ground-breaking photographers. You don’t have to be an art historian nor
even like photography to love this deeply soul satisfying work. Each work is a gem to be savored and
appreciated like a fine work of visual art." (Booktrib.com)

What makes Eight Girls Taking Pictures so remarkable is its simultaneous sharp focus and wide-angle lens.
Through the lives of eight women photographers, Whitney Otto allows readers to see their own immediate
worlds and the alternative, otherwise inaccessible worlds of women artists. We share the inscape of these
characters’ psychologies and the countries and times that frame and shape their work; their struggles to
practice their art are both extraordinary and hauntingly familiar. Eight Girls Taking Pictures takes us through
the twentieth century in a way that immeasurably enriches our lives and our futures.” (Sena Jeter Naslund
author of Ahab’s Wife, Four Spirits, and Adam & Eve)

“A lovely work of fiction…Otto mixes thepersonal histories of her subjects with their camera-eye view of
the world tocreate an intriguing narrative. [She] has done what literary fiction can dobest — bring the reader
into the hearts and minds of these fierce, radicalartists.” (Chicago Tribune)

“A tour de force. This exquisitely written novel-as-linked-stories is an impressive ode to feminism. Spanning
several decades and various romantic settings…Otto’s novel highlights the challenges these women face as
they attempt to balance career with family life. Like a master portraitist, Otto focuses on the details,
describing studio settings as if she were staging a photograph herself.” (BookPage)

"A fascinating portrait of 20th century women exploring and establishing their artistic vision. Writing with
vivid details and finely-tuned sensibility...Otto's ability to capture and corral [these women's] lives... is
laudable for shedding light on this sisterhood of pioneering artists.” (San Jose Mercury News)



EIGHT GIRLS TAKING PICTURES (BASIC) BY WHITNEY
OTTO PDF

Download: EIGHT GIRLS TAKING PICTURES (BASIC) BY WHITNEY OTTO PDF

Just how if your day is started by checking out a book Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney
Otto However, it remains in your device? Everybody will certainly always touch as well as us their gadget
when waking up and also in morning tasks. This is why, we mean you to also check out a book Eight Girls
Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto If you still confused how you can obtain the book for your gadget,
you could adhere to the way here. As below, we provide Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney
Otto in this internet site.

Positions now this Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto as one of your book collection!
However, it is not in your bookcase compilations. Why? This is guide Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By
Whitney Otto that is given in soft file. You can download the soft data of this incredible book Eight Girls
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Whitney Otto straight. It might require more times to go store by establishment. This is why we mean you
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Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto Also this is soft documents book, it will certainly be simplicity to
bring Eight Girls Taking Pictures (Basic) By Whitney Otto wherever or save in the house. The difference is
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location. You could require just copy to the various other tools.

http://bookpeace.com/site-ebook/1410454428


EIGHT GIRLS TAKING PICTURES (BASIC) BY WHITNEY
OTTO PDF

A New York Times Bestselling Author -- In a profoundly moving novel, the bestselling author of How to
Make an American Quilt imagines the thoughts and circumstances that produced eight famous female
photographers of the twentieth century. This captivating novel opens in 1917 as Cymbeline Kelley surveys
the charred remains of her photography studio, destroyed by a woman hired to help take care of the house
while Cymbeline pursues her career. This tension -- between domestic duty and ambition, between public
and private life, between what's seen and what's hidden from view -- echoes in the stories of the other seven
women in the book.
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Amazon.com Review
Amazon Best Books of the Month, December 2012: We rarely hear grown women called "girls" these days,
unless they've gone wild, but it was common practice in the settings for Whitney Otto's affecting portraits of
female artists. The author, who has spun tales of women and crafts before (eight other ladies starred in her
1991 best seller, How to Make an American Quilt), takes a fresh approach here. More a novel in linked
pieces than a set of discrete works, Eight Girls Taking Pictures introduces a range of protagonists in various
eras and countries, each with a shutter-happy dream and an obstacle in the way of achieving it. These
roadblocks take the form of men--unrelenting fathers, unsympathetic husbands--and social trends, including
racism, homophobia, and aversion to the idea of females as creative. Otto's intelligent, sensitive approach to
the plight of these women gives Eight Girls its appeal: Safe in our modernity, we trust that their talent will
win out in the end. --Mia Lipman

From Booklist
Inspired by the careers of such ground-breaking photographers as Lee Miller, Imogen Cunningham, and
Grete Stern, Otto combines her personal passion for the art of photography with her perceptive impressions
of what life must have been like for those women who pursued their own creative and philosophical muses
during times when to be anything other than a wife-and-mother was to be an outcast from society. Through
loosely interconnected tales, Otto introduces eight exemplary fictional women photographers whose lives
and works document the exhilarating intersection of early-twentieth-century art and feminism. Traversing the



world from Berlin to Buenos Aires, Otto’s heroines find themselves both catalysts for and captives of
changing times and values. From the makeshift darkroom of the pioneering Cymbeline Kelley to the Parisian
portrait studio of Amadora Allesbury to the New York landscapes captured by Miri Marx, Otto’s
photographers battle society’s denunciations and personal demons as they seek love, acceptance, success,
and harmony. A visionary and distinctive look at the sacrifices and triumphs of daring women artists. --Carol
Haggas

Review
"Thoughtful, nuanced depictions of the complexity of women's lives...Eight Girls is a moving read about the
pleasures and pangs that define the lives of women today." (USA Today)

"A rich ensemble novel...full of glamour and grit." (New York Times, T. Style Magazine)

" Otto’s photographers battle society’s denunciations and personal demons as they seek love, acceptance,
success, and harmony. A visionary and distinctive look at the sacrifices and triumphs of daring women
artists." (Booklist)

“Otto skillfully develops each character and draws the reader in with rich detail that must be the result of
careful and extensive research. Highly recommended; those with an interest in photography, women’s
history, or feminist literature should particularly enjoy.” (Library Journal)

"Blending Otto's saturated yet accessible prose with her talent for stitching together stories of multiple
characters with a steady, glittering needle, the novel pays homage to a number of 20th-century photographers
whose lives inspired its eight interwoven tales. Otto's vivid narratives of these women's lives-often
bohemian, occasionally luxurious, always richly intellectual and full of love-render them as complete,
complicated mediums between their cameras and a world that treats them so ambivalently." (Portland
Monthly)

"The reader is captivated and transported on several levels with a book that rings with universal truths as it
pays homage to eight very real ground-breaking photographers. You don’t have to be an art historian nor
even like photography to love this deeply soul satisfying work. Each work is a gem to be savored and
appreciated like a fine work of visual art." (Booktrib.com)

What makes Eight Girls Taking Pictures so remarkable is its simultaneous sharp focus and wide-angle lens.
Through the lives of eight women photographers, Whitney Otto allows readers to see their own immediate
worlds and the alternative, otherwise inaccessible worlds of women artists. We share the inscape of these
characters’ psychologies and the countries and times that frame and shape their work; their struggles to
practice their art are both extraordinary and hauntingly familiar. Eight Girls Taking Pictures takes us through
the twentieth century in a way that immeasurably enriches our lives and our futures.” (Sena Jeter Naslund
author of Ahab’s Wife, Four Spirits, and Adam & Eve)

“A lovely work of fiction…Otto mixes thepersonal histories of her subjects with their camera-eye view of
the world tocreate an intriguing narrative. [She] has done what literary fiction can dobest — bring the reader
into the hearts and minds of these fierce, radicalartists.” (Chicago Tribune)

“A tour de force. This exquisitely written novel-as-linked-stories is an impressive ode to feminism. Spanning
several decades and various romantic settings…Otto’s novel highlights the challenges these women face as
they attempt to balance career with family life. Like a master portraitist, Otto focuses on the details,
describing studio settings as if she were staging a photograph herself.” (BookPage)



"A fascinating portrait of 20th century women exploring and establishing their artistic vision. Writing with
vivid details and finely-tuned sensibility...Otto's ability to capture and corral [these women's] lives... is
laudable for shedding light on this sisterhood of pioneering artists.” (San Jose Mercury News)

Most helpful customer reviews

18 of 19 people found the following review helpful.
"Nothing is any one thing really, and isn't that the beauty of it all?"
By Amelia Gremelspacher
Above all this book is about the world of women in the arts. Otto introduces the reader to the world of
photography and it's inherent ambiguities. As a printed reflection of a moment in time, it would seem
superficially to be more representative than other art forms. Yet we learn tha tphotography, as all art, is never
just one thing.
So it is with women divided between the traditional roles of helpmate, parent , and homemaker competing
with the often selfish role of artist. The girls in the book are born into worlds from the early 1900's to the
present. The cameras they use vary. The settings range from the farm to pre war Berlin. They are the
proverbial free woman or wife and mother. But each must master the contradictions in their worlds.
Reactions to photography can be extreme, given that the nudes are demonstrably real people. Otto does a
good job of leaving some judgements for us to desolate for ourselves.
Otto describes the worlds of these women in such a way that one can taste the internal conflict inherent in
each. The first story presents a young mother, left to care for two children and a farm, while her narcissistic
husband travels for his work. Her own photography is often caught in the bind despite her own superior
credentials. I sighed, thinking here is the classic woman's story. But Otto takes it quickly into her interior
world and brought me in. Cymbeline, trained in Berlin, is the first cameo, and her views reappear through
this book. I think that the vignettes set in pre WWII Berlin were most bewitching to me. The frisson between
the exquisite glowing world of the growth of the arts and the looming of the Nazi end of it all, plays out in
the world of the girls taking pictures.
Otto notes that this is not biographical, but she did draw heavily on her researched stories of some prominent
women photographers. The aesthetics she expresses read true and brought me to a new view of this art form.
An interesting book to experience.

5 of 5 people found the following review helpful.
Women behind the lens
By Cate Garrison
Once again, Whitney Otto has woven together, melding fact and fiction seamlessly along the way, a handful
of lives in a space/time continuum where the common threads are art (specifically photography) and the role
of women in society. Her subjects are fascinating both in themselves, and in their interplay. In particular, the
image of the woman, once a world-traveler and now, having started a family, taking pictures only through
her apartment window, haunts the reader for a long time (I can't stop thinking of The Lady of Shalott).
Woman trapped...if trapped she is...not only behind a lens, but also behind a pane of glass? And yet the
photographs are beautiful...is she happy with her lot?
Several of these women are recognizable as historical figures, others not. This is a glorious book, and I
recommend it highly.

6 of 7 people found the following review helpful.
Life lived. And reimagined through a woman's eyes.
By guiltlessreader
Amazing! This makes it as another of my favourite reads for the year. With the same appeal as Otto's How to
Make an American Quilt, this is altogether bold, romantic, tender and outspoken. I loved everything about it
and I could relate on so many levels, as a woman, and as someone who has always been fascinated with



photography and art in general.

The novel is broken up into eight sections, each featuring a famous female photographer and her story. The
obvious common thread -- photography -- is just one among the many threads that hold the individual stories
together. Spanning decades (early 1990s to the present), across several continents, during various historical
moments -- these themes are the stuff of our lives. I just breathed it all in! I am betting that women readers
will be able to relate to one (or more) of the eight characters in some way.

Women photographers are simply ordinary women who face the issues all women do: the men (or women)
who we love, fulfilling the roles expected of women (or breaking out of them), feeling comfortable in one's
sexuality, children (or none at all), of wanting to carve out one's one path personally and career-wise. What
makes a woman happy? What makes you happy?

What sets these eight women apart is their vision (and tempestuousness) to continue with their craft -- and do
so with great courage and passion -- despite (or inspite) of the many hurdles. They all managed to make their
mark in photography in rather profound ways.

Each vignette opens with a photograph which figures in the story somehow (and which I tended to flip back
and forth to try and see the image through that particular photographer's eyes).

The first photographer's story opens with the photo of an unmade bed with some hairpins. Note that all these
photos are apparently taken by real women photographers, and then the characters' lives are reimagined by
the author based on that photo. How creative and what a wonderful way to draw readers in! Of course I want
to find out who Cymbeline is, who this "woman in love" is! Of course I want to know the story behind that
unmade bed. Like we always say, a picture is worth a thousand words ... in this case, the words follow.

Each has made their own distinctive mark in the world of photography -- with some extremely fascinating
points woven into the narratives. There are references to photography styles and influences, lenses and
cameras and details that will satisfy the photography buff. And since this draws from the lives of women
photographers, there is a list at the end of the book you can check out.

See all 46 customer reviews...
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